
 



NT temperament 
The main thing for me is development of 
thinking. I collect data consisting of 
abstractions and possibilities and use them 
to initiate an objective decision-making 
process. 
 

Mind map 
My creative work involves making a mind 
map where I focus on both the process and 
result to immediately see the big picture 
when setting a challenge and arrive at an 
objective decision. 
 

Science and technology creativity 
I enjoy setting IT challenges for myself. I'm 
happy to solve them while creating code in 
an IDE and get an engineering solution in 
the form of a program and device. 
 

Management 
I create an atmosphere and value system, 
determine the course an organization 
should follow, use software as a tool, and 
think and work creatively. 
 

Idea and attitude to power 
Understand and contribute to the concept, 
propose a model, influence the future. 
 
 

How I spend my day 
I seek to make my day interesting and 
memorable with accomplished work, 
pleasant communication, and good mood. 
 
 

Behavioral model 
Professional discussion of strengths and 
weaknesses after work completion by the 
team. 
 

Fashion 
I choose comfortable  I'm accustomed to. 
When shopping, I consider price and 
durability. 
 

Love 
I enjoy the communication, relationships 
come along to develop, things are working 
out better. 

 

Cake 
One of my favorite desserts is the 
Napoleon cake. I like going to cafés for a 
good mood. 
 

Money 
To see more and further ahead, I created a 
trading bot to read prices and place 
effective orders on the exchange according 
to the algorithm. 
 

 

 

 


